| wau @12 aqeam wsr-qm, fadiis win 4 (%) fA7F 1-4-1987
- q 9%5ifag gar |

faendt streqor fawr
wiag=
SqYT, WAT 1, 1987
deqr q. 2 (8) faurdy/s7.—wewA  usa faqwa-avew w1 feifie

- gfafaga, (8 UsINT F ARl (Iiw 30 HiA, 1987 € Fr19rq g%, Taggm
agATGIIo L gANA Awthwa foar stran g -

et fa Afafaaq, 1987

(1987 w1 wiutraw dear 7)

| TsaarE # ARl (G 30 AT, 1987 ¥ sy 5%) ]

faqt ' 1987-88 ¥ forg Tow wew 1 & faclia Seardi #1 Twrat woy
fRrg TrsteaT fawa- Afafran, 1954, Useaw fadq (wew) wfufawm, 1962,
(AT &1 fqtg (wgaw) wtufraw, 1952 S vwew@ aaem §ig q

T AT wlutTaw, 196 1% HR dnifaa w37 & fog qov wfqawa wvq  afcadq
A & (1Y HraiTas |

ARATANUT & HIAAE ad § Uweam Uy fauA-aea  faeafatas
glafaqs IT7aT g—

HEQTa ]
Tfsrs

1. Hfeea am.~—ga wfufaaw w1 am Toeam G sfafaan, 1987

1 e i 1 50 49



2 QAAIAA AR-9d, WA 1, 1987 T 4 (%)

2. 1958%F UAAT HAiTqH 23 W URT 3% 141 TR ~—THEATA

wAfea ST AIgO AiufTaw, 1958 (1958 FT1 WA HlafTaR 23) & & 3
& HAACO #, qHR FrarMiad (a1 sran § o Avefea § ag aitiv g (v ga wfu-
frrawr ®Y g 18 39 Alaf=an & wdlw e gt e

HEATT-11
Tsrea faen-we wfutqaw, 1954 | duiius

3. 1954 & QAT wiafaaw 29 &1 417 2 &T AN, —qA™ T

faora-we wtufaas, 1954 (1954 %1 O™ Hfufvaw 29), fs& ga weam
w17 far-9< Afufrmw w8 aar g, ¥ awy 2 #,—

(%) @z (¥F) H, atweafsa « “dfaar’ ' & vam ax wfasate « “dfaar
a1 wg-gfazt’ "’ sfaearfaa w1 A

(@) faormm @oe (W) & s ) favafataa afaeafoa fear sam,
AT~ |

“(or) “fasa’ AT AT qWEX SATHLIIF TI-WIT Wi oAy D &.

el Q@ ST & FIT (el o safea Y st & aww # awe

g HrEAfrd AN HUAT T [ea AT Gfawq & fou 7 § mafa

B AT AFALW (W, HEWE, awr gy ey §  wewdn)
nfqda g WX 3qH afrafaa § —

(1) 7%, EAMT G0 A1 A=A eqnd qfqe & fqg W«
geafa &1, (el dfaar & oFese ¥ Aw9T, $18 Hadr;

(i) fray dfararsd-afasr & froaes & A & fean aan
qTe § Tl (|18 A & ®9 § g a0 () wew w7 §) w

g HFAL;
(iii) wa*F a1 faeal T 4 DA ol eamwt & afeqa;

(iv) «&Fe, wreafra ITF AT Req qeaarq Tfaws & fqy, fwed W
TARA & {70 71 ®T AR ©FH F AW HT R qraq o0
(=g =g fr fafatese swmaiy & g g aragl) ;

(v) =afwat & et Wt sfawfaa &aw an fawa g o9l fe
qITT FY AFT, AT AT AT %7 {eqarq Sfaws & fag

HIST HT FIs NI ;

(vi) =t Iow & fag A, o fe g a1 O W geg aeg Y
g1 faeg) WY 9 (g 9 HEw gV av Ag0 ) &7, fed W {ar e

2



am 4 (=) CIHEATA  TRA-TH, AAA 1, 1987 3

T & OT IaF I B § waar fwat Wt wew fa ¥ ae
9317, Wi OAT TN AP, ARAT qI3w AVwA  AeAAH
gfa®s & tag gi-

AT QA TR, AR QUIIT F13 {77 qwan AEAT WX g s an
‘g Wl o AT FY TOAT AIAAT;

g s\ ~1fT s § aeaf w1 F1E wego G fatgewe afufra
1956 (1956 w1 FFha wfafaaw 74) ®Y 9T 4 F I9-
g1Tr (2) FY wreresi vy Qi wET § O A U & Wi
fiwart g wwaT s

(1) =oz () ®,—

(1) wsdt “gfaga & a7 9T o Cfasa & afawq’ & @ia |
o e R g &7 ge fam st

(ii) famaw avgw & s o faratatas sfaenfaa v sman,
TATA

“oqeg faEdt MAFT-FUL X AIHA ¥ I a0 #1, wafs
qT 0 AT F TeNF weafed fwan qanar,  wre w1 qwne
Heq Wi T fasq—Aex awan san; ;) i

(iii) za ww sfeenfer qEw@ owges & g fReatate
. qGgE SIS ATAAT, FATA -

“atry ug MY T forelt wrd-difean & ddy # fara-qag
qg THA 0T St IR fAsqrew & d9u H§ w3 ), foad aeqer
/TS w1 7_eq ML oA fAeqrea § seadfag woget aur ey

Y

gqaiT afenafag g; " ; AW
(a) @oz (|) &,—

(i) san qtas¥Swqd mat faemn afweafaa & 2o q fara-
fafega staeafaa fwat saas, watd—

 Hougrag & et swEgtdl & ER, @ () H fafds

el WY Ofa 3 et faga, seawt, afw™ gt vem Ffac
STeR AT g faFr qral s g weAalnaa g ;g

(i) =wefvwewr (1) ¥ wiveataa ‘e |@iqar”’ o afweatza
“F ddg W' & i ¥ wiveataa “ar i se-dfan” it

3



4 TREATT A9, TAAX 1, 1987 w4 (%)

 sfvreafan ‘AR O ge @s’ wiX sfweafw w1 & £
& ae’ & S # afweafea ‘e fw fafga t&war e’
e EqT(A HY AN !

4. 1954 & Troreq™ wiufaaw 20 § G g 5 TFF BT HI TG, ~

Ty T W N T T T o L . WA S A TR TR IR - - A I SR G T i E——

faera-w3 wfufraw w1 o 5-0% & qeAq (AeAfAf@a AW gGRT 5-BFF
et T wy S, wata--

“5-F & w . wfaum w3 & 3TN M qAgw w1 fafermmwor. - (1) fwe
Wl e, sfawcor v oawwcw & fEg W fRua, et
AR A el A FDAZC A 2 AL, 1983 & Uweqw  faw
atafran, 1987 & FIIER 1 ATND T F1 FIoAly & Aoy H a2 &
gz (o) & Su-gue (vi) # sofafess sqm & &g § v wiufaw &
TNT ITTE an & g, T1IITF a1 G o s & ferg amedtaa s
T TR qA T & forg @ a fafuar = & & sgndia av andia fwg go
qRA AT AT A SU-Geg (vi) S awY arfers awul g7 9G4 a@n
T QAT & ITTEQ A1 A o T av

(2) ®§ W A AT H FEAE OF FT &, A & v (1) H
ftse fergr st &, sfaam & faa fad W /e, wrfuw<or g sifaso
¥ STt qn e T Agt S ;i S |y e, wfewe ar mfy-
weor et it g fauig, fafrea ar smw & wataa 7@t s faew
IR firet o8 &2 w1 ww & Tfaety sy fAew faarmaran 7

5. 1954 ¥ UM sfafwaw 29 & gy 5-F 1 T, o -

5 I TR TR R - R R L T T P T T TR ST S T SR

% Tfafaad ®1 a1 5-F W,—

(%) faaam@IT-arr (3) & Teatd fAratafes =i S-uro sFacen(aa
N AT, AAT—

“(4) = 5 | fedt T & i gu W faeg Saet St (1) & 9w
RAF & FEENT [a gC Feaw sgagrd, e qunad § e
2 & gug (o) & Iu-gee (iv) & qufatas fadl 79 =71 90
I F & AgER & Ao & qrasyg § fosrql @ awafeas
qograd afrafaa g, oF faoral & wouw weEs & qafyg quarEd o
I AfTma q w=fas w1 gaEl I 9, S ST A&EW  gRI
US-ad § wrfagiea w1 919, s@ wtufrae & wdw $T d@@w@ w3
A fq7a-fa ara @1 "/ & 3 wgar sgagiieat & fwea-faea
aml & fau s &t faA-faea o sfugfaa & Srasan ;) @i

(@) faemm S (4) Swar@ (5) & &9 § ga: gewifsa
FY ST W W TFR g FEifEd Ie-m (5) F @ 9w
farafafaa sfaeanfon fwar smam, aatq:-

4



4 (#)

| " 1 e (4) & werva wrs wfgg=aT @<
g 9T 9T g H fAiEe fawui s ada 8 915 W@ w7
YT 5 & FET @=¥7 qg0 gwn 17y

LIHEATH AR-qA, AGA 1, 1987 5

P Rl rarrgr il Xl

6. 1954 & e Afufaaw 29 & 5-%  #T1 SMud.—fawa-7
giafagr &1 ara 5-7 & I (1) ®, w¥ ‘dem & wy wfw g7
e weAt ‘et g F wiwwwd’ & drw Wi weet few wfama’ ¥ oym av

msz oqrg wfama’”’ afqenfoa &g sngd

7. 1954 F AT Afataaw 29 M T 7-FF &1 WA~ faun-
wT Hiafqaes & gaR1 7-%% |7 Atweatww ‘Taeed (7 77 & wam gv
Avegty ‘g AMA H, It WU 7&0 999t (2%) & welw New
i Azw fEmr Q@ wdtwg 2, 9 suad Aafew Hiw seg aed e §
qia wqy sfafzw’ Ak wiveatsy “extew’’ & vue ov gluefss “od
faaeont seqa wex A sufaewe’ wiaeadsa & snad o

8. 1954 & TwEATT Hiafaaw 29 F UTXT 9 FT AMAA.~ {awy-wT wiufamy
F AT 9 @ ST (3) W (EEHIA @ (%) WY A (@) TH@
gre (&) witc @oz (W) F w0 A G wenifwd Gy Sran WX 9 9ET 9N
Haifea @oe (@) & ugd faeataten sdaenfua foar smam,  aukg-

“(=) QA WA, FTFEF A1 AR FT T GH, TIEX AT HAT  F FQOT ATA
gafum quarad W 0T @R, IR AT AT F T TEGHT B T7T
% adg N g3 T T AU 59 Tw 1< fwar Sr @@ /Ty g r .8
At fawzs, q7 gar o favrsw w8 g @ e sm Afufaow &
AT TG ALTA E AW ;T

9. 1954 F TAAFHTA WUTAAN 29 FY AW 1 0-9 F GWtaA.~ w1 sfyr-

T Gt G I T N L T T T R T S T T T S Nt - e T T L PR LT ., NI

fram &Y g 10-9 & F3aT70 (1) F @Ue (1) o faaaa weg TR A e
9T sy ‘s’ afarenfos (wur st

10. 1954 & AT AT 29 & AW 11-9 & dMe—{Tw6a-%7

SRR, N .- SO ottt S - A ‘a M -t - YT S . 4 W e Iy

mafaas & g 11-9 /,—

(%) Jeanw (1) & eqedtweor | wiwentaq “10-%" W wfwenfaa
“13 a1 14" & Dx A wiwealya Y1) AT W SOy W

(w) =t w50 Wt @ex @ avr Y wrovafa as @A sfawa sfang #Hi
17 X AA TATAN BAG ®X N TAF aF 33 atwwr’ ww Fi
TAT TATT 97 A3 AT HIA T ATAF AF G wamA’ e oy
BT W@ AT ALY @Y wraraly oF qan staaa sfrag € 2 g
FAT TEATY NI AT LA & NIy ay dr ataws” g
S AR YRR QT 0 Ve 1wt &Y wide g ow o aoaaa
sfaeariqa f@aT qan



6 TEAEA A9, 513 1, 1987 it 4 (%)
——— _

11. 1954 % TAHYTA Hwiataaw 29 HY 0T 14 77 anA—fasa-v7  ufy-

— e

Fa Y T 14 F 0811 ( 3) W 5AY C180) & TR 0% w7365 Sfveartia
feq A

B %

12. 1954 % TASTeATT qiafqaaw 29 #Y a1 16 &7 dmay—fasa-57 wf-

.__________'“—_—-'—:'————-——-_ ]
P Y aTT 16 B ITUR (3) B @92 () W, (qqq07 wreatsa “aa it 2,
¥ agarq famara waz “ar” @i A gerr g g Freafafay ata ¥ waeataa
B2 7on agzr wmam,  watg—

EISEIRT.~~TH @S F WL F I WAY A9 qF A @A AT AT qH
AT ® % fr dam qgl we fomn war & o’

13. 1954 % Tweama wfafema 29 #Y a1 22 F1 AU~ FTFITT H0-
(470 FY arT 22 F1 ITART (6) & @S (%) W, Wl “Iad Ppar ST
AAA safEa B A Faelt St A A AP HR F wlvq wrq T F A O

TT v A wfaET wun safiw GR fee ma #afacgda w aen
Taeutfaa fed a@d o

14, 1954 & “ToreenA wiufagw 29 Y aror 22-%% T dmgH.— fa%a-
‘-‘._-'—‘m'_-———-——_-:r————_——m—.__—____
T Afatraw & a0 22-FF oA~

(%) g witeF § faerma wadt “site w1 afcaga w38 Ty axfaami”
T A1 9T NeT Ui g sfaeutfaa e wman;

(@) 37ar (1), (2) =X (3) §, Jg w40 W 767 “q10 WA F WA
T AIFT RIA T FCIZA LA AT H1g W ufaa’”’ W a7 “ar Ty

F WA Ot q1gT A1 w1 afeagq wOX aran oan A1 o safad” wma
g1 3¢ g1 faar smam; site

() ewedtETor &1 @oz (i) g=v femr ardar

15. 1954 & TeAta wiafaaw 29 § 74t arar 22— &1 Haeqqq.~F=2-

B e N~ Tl ~ - W s S e
¥ Fatas & 4R 22-9 F JIA (ARG A1 GIQ HATANAT 7Y AR,
aaia:——

C22-u. M & Tew W mra w0 osaa—( 1) B Wy s

(T g an®i & AT FATIRAT BT 771 ) ot AT B WAL GTAT, FTAT
T WA F T UF gL 97T A1 gAY wiftra qEw HT ST AW R A9T-
TEITT A5 AT A & T ¥ AT &, FAATA FRAT & AT AeqST AR
BT § T AT I A3 IAF KA %1 Awg eura feam 2 av otz dar o
enA gt gl At agt 9gt ag v faavg s @, wfrwfar cad

6



WwRT 4 (!?) AT qHGH, AT 1, 1987 7

r oanpeme yma ar e etk bl

a'r% fratcor st &, fafza g & g3t 9= avanr i fafga geq gfv-
g FE ¢

q&q AZT BIS ATART] TAT AIA HICAT & Wl & A oeqQqr san
&, WATE FLAT g AT FGAT A FIAT g agi ag, % fawsw qx, o
w1 fafga &g afadtrg #T a6 A g 97 NI FT AT TTT AFA-
TN HTA A faEs @A 3 9@t ag Irafwa fwan stvdnt i gan aier oF safsq
gra ST & WAy @aet aar g

(2) =GO HT QAT AFY AIA & X A FT4T TR AT G 22-%
# et fafga Ao aEraen & ar-ary gqn T A6 a7 9eqd fman aarn
T IIF G & IS T AT 9 AW ENT 17

16. 1954 & Traea™ afafaam 29 Y w23 w1 daga.—faswg-w7 qfiy.

frraw &1 a1 23 F1 ITART  (2) A (AOATA stweatad 127, F &4 q%

sfeafaa “24 %" sfaeadfog v qm@t

17. 1954 & Tteu ufafaaw 29 ® g 26 F1 AMUA.—Fawq-w<
wifafraw &t ara 26 Ft IO (2) H fawna ave (1) & oA feafafaa
T goy s fEwr ww@w, s

“(wn) dfazt ot wa-dfeat & fReqrea & gww & f5d w7 7 &
qeqfa & weaTo (argaama'%'w R/ 21 an fwat oty ga § ) ¥ forg swagr@

H1 A3 THA FT AIGNX;

(8. 1954 & uwrearx ufufmaw 29 #t wAg=t &1 dmaa, —fasea-w7 giy-
frm @ AW ST R/,

(%) wa den 2 &, frawa sfafe “(a) v g@r @ @aa; s

(m) ==z 3§, traar afafe ¥ ad g “aron g (g qui awgEa
&Y 1 38A § aaaed fAww fag m g ow wwoww fad ad @

at)” g fad wmad

7qsYTq-11
et @ (uew ) wfutwam, 1962 § A

19. 1962 & T(TEAT Hieiaam 12 &Y G 3 FT AMyA.—Trorear (s

(wew) sfataaq, 1962 (1962 #1 Twredra wfutqaa 12) % 4T 3 § Al
fia “gauga Hat o A gwaatd “ata afqe F watus odr 3 F dx A qm
afweafan “6 A3 48" & e q¢ afweafed “gq A7 sfreafa @ san



5 UAEATH TH-TH, AAF 1, 1987 T 4 (%)
, . .;m_;___—_‘

AT -]V

TS e fafy (wawad) stafaa, 1952 § dataa

-
-

20. 1952 & T Ratagy 7 &0 AT wIgeEl &1 Gaga.—Oaedam™
__“H____m

t2vem (@ (F%aa) atufaam, 1952 (1952 %1 O@eA afataqq 7) 3
dam fgdw wagEn ® -

(1) & 1® &17q 2 #, waal “gw qqar” & eav qT o ‘ot sra” sfiyear
fa1 Frn g
(ii) H.' 2 ﬁ;-““‘

(%) #vwa 1 § faemw @oe (§) WiR (@) 227 f2q @aw; wix

(F) &vw 2 ¥, g2 (%) W (@) & aW 1 faaam afweafas
® T a2 faeafafan wfaenfaa fear s, aetq —

YT F HFT & NAT W WYG 41 I W ¥ fag mfuwaw 50
¥97 & ReqtT @A gu aitw wom 1

(111) ®. 3% waew 2 &, wedi “dim Tod” & 2417 9T w053 “avet wan” wf-
wfey fex s

(1v) &. 4 % eaew 2 §, weal “gi9 w70 & &A1 9% q5F "I s03”’ 9fa-
Tariag g s

(v) ® 5 % sgww 2 #,-

(%) @vs (%) & qreed, ekt “ow T & ear R Awer “qta TR
gfaearias  fieg g ;

(@) @ (@) & aw, afwafs “ox war, afusas @@ o
T & Tt a3 sivsaty Coiw wad, stfuwaa ow §t 593 a9
afaeatiaa ®1 wm; st

() @oe () ¥ AW weSi ‘A WE” B v X wer “atm TR
gfaeutiag w9 @man; -

(vi) d.6 & w19 2 #, faemma afveafad & cam ax fasafafeq
' sfaearfaa fear sgan, aatq-—— .

6. gw faval & faete, quaw an fieEt & d@dfaa sae-nata
treafafag & @afug v s ofvog s et w1 faga—

(1) ofgw-fadra ar forgal w1 faela fray feeh amfa oz faquy
steifa & fasr g @ o @Y srat @ an §;



w4 (%) AAAE  TF-qd, A% 1, 1987 9

(2) stoa qeafa w1 Qo an forelt szt 6 dar e, aoas A
e, sae § afaw fag a7 an f‘aa' A AT YA & wFqAr

:?I%TH JT AT 0 F 7Y AN & fog wfawfa & =0 §

(%) afz Qa1 9um a1 %W, AiT O AT Y THT X A FO A QUi
w3 aret foga 1 ari & i wia & wiuw 8, wfawas 8-

(1) gt sere a7 o #Y R 1200/- % 3 qie {9
Tferw T &Y
(ii) wmtag 1200/-% A wfrmaY fFg qeEg T
5,000/-%. & wfas A 8Y;
(1i1) i ag 5,000/- 7. ¥ nfuw g 677 gt T
10,000/- & & Afuw 7 ¥;
(iv) =gt a8 10,000/- 5. & mfirs 3Y feg TIATEHY TUT
30,000/-%. T oifasw 7 AY;
(v) wgiag 30,000/-%. ¥ wfrs &) freg % t o=
50,000/- €. A AMF TV ; WX 7T
(vi) szt ag 50,000/- % ¥ wfas &Y A@l dra T

50,000/- ¥. ¥ FAT XAF 10,000/ T.
a7 9% W & fom; wmiR

(=) afz g sur av wo qat faga it stfawa & & fog
T & dv wr & wfus qaaa § gz (%) & A

sfireida g § 3 WA 1A o

s Taw & qoraw g1 et #t forgd afe nawmfog 7 v aE g0

(vii) & 7% cgew 2 ¥, wed) “redim g0’ H oW U< T amme T
gfaenfaa fea saE;

(viii) &. 8 ¥ caew 2 ¥, 9oz (F) F Ay AT wee | ‘AOT AT qAr@qY
F T 9T w7 ‘o=rm 7ud” afaearfia i wae

(iX) &. 9& T 2%51'3?“wg*€w”%wr'sw'“?“'f‘m wqg’ afa-
IRa fod s



10 A TH-AH, A 1, 1987 AT 4 (F)

= BT Al . P

(x) &.10% &ww 19 2 ¥, faerma afweafaaal €T O° frrafefaa
gfaeaifag fear  smgmT,  wxid—

“10. wFOAY F AW HATHE,~

(1) wgtdaas 1 a@ 5. & wias 78Y; 2 Ot T
(ii) sgtag 1@ e Agfr frg 5@ E A OF EAR TN
Afuw 7 g5
(iii) =gt ag 5 @ma = ¥ wfirs g faeg 20 M@ & A AT T

o wuF A gy; W

(iv) w1gtag 20 ®tg ®. & wfas g T@l 20 AW & U WL T
¥ T AT 5 AIG & AT U W & 0

QY T B MATHT AV AT 3 Forg AFT T AT § HR K FFIA A
fagd, 1955 H g 26 ¥ N WoEdTa AT aAr 0

(Xi) @ 12% taew 28 @ve (@) & et wid gedl “Felte Td T AR’
& W QT gag fgure wuy gfeeaded & soAe;

(xii) &. 15 % T@¥q 1 AT 2 §, f=mm gisnfadl & o a7 famatatesa
afgrnfea fFar =T, #a—

“15. g 2 #F g (5) ¥ gamfonfad ger-ad W e A
Y A S @ wfufrm g o gt @ atafam, 1870 (1870 #
Feava wiufem 7), Stet fy eeam & fag sasfas fean ma g, g
Suafeerd 8 WRAT A gl

(1) =t sfas@ ww arae 100/- % ¥ 7faF 7 & qi €9

(i) sgiag 100/- % & wfuw & fg 500/- 7. A AtwTw Iq T
qTE;

(iii) wetag 500/-% & whrw & feeg 1,000/-5. &  daww
nioF 7 gl; '

(iv) w&tag 1,000/ % & wfaw g feeg 50,000/-7  g==a €93
& wifu 7 gt @t 1,000/ T ¥ FAL FAEF 500/-%.
a1 IaE Wi & feg;

10



w4 (%) AR TA-TA, ATA 1, 1987 11

M Be - oaee TSR AT W - = e i P, A Y iy, =g -x, sl el i

(V) S&iag 50,000/- % & wfus & agi 50,000/- . A g
¥ FIR IEF 500/ § AT IqF A & fora v

(X111) & 17 % eaeq 2 ¥, qa=f “ardg €a3” ¥ S qT WeT “oerg saa”’
gtaratfaa f@g s,

(XIv) & 18 & wwry 2 ®,—
(F) @ (%) & A&7 Wt “qamw @ F W 0w e qi e
gfacatfog fea san; AR

H‘I

(@) @2 (=) ¥ am? i “faggat 477 & s av v “aiw
'qq wiaeatioa twa s@w;

(XV) &. 22 & taww 2 ¥, weal “idia w0d” & 919 qT wer “daTeia
qqu’  wigearfaa fea snaw;

(Xvl) & 23 & T*9 1 %X 2 A, fagwtr siveatsagl ¥ cne qv faem-
tateaa wizeatdaa f@ar smam, gata—

Y23, "I 2 F IT-ART (10) F auwfAriva geITACOr-uw,—

(1) st AT |qea 200/ 7. F Afars 7 8Y; WEg TG

(11) sgi=g 200/- % & wierw g1 fveg 500/-%. @ gt goa
oferw T gY;

(111) wgiag 500/- = & wfaw g %77 1,000/-5. ¥  ggT 7oa
qiers 7 gl ;

(1v) wigi g 1,000 -&. A nfuwgifaeg 10,000/~  dareitw soa
T A RETF TGN, 1,000/-%. A F9T TIF 500/-
€. g1 I W & f&o;

(v) Sigiag 10,000/- & A HiGF gl tag 25,000/~ aaqq Ta@
T aufaw s g, 10,000/- € & FAT AT 500/-
%. g1 I9a AW & f«q;

(vi) wtgiag 25,000/-% & 5w 3%+ 50,000/-7. T TOR
F ferss A g, 25,000 /- &V HIX IAF 500/-3.
a1 I WET & (F0; HqiX

(vil) =gtag 50,000/- % & stfirs g agt 50,000/-%. AT T
A T T4 5001- . I ITH WIT & (T \

11



12 TSR TA-qA, w9 1, 1987 W o4 (w)

Nl A - —_— T - '“--—-_.-——..—-.-“--u—-—---l

ST

arearg Sfafaaatur wfufaaw, 1957 & =R =4 o wfafer  zn
gfafaafase &  guaRmA U

(xvil) & 24 & & 2 ¥H,—

L ‘u”

(%) @ve (1) & @A, weal ‘@ ¥9q’ & T q¥ weE ot Tud
aearfaa fwa smaw;  WR

(@) @ve (ii) & @7, Wl ‘g @ & ®WE 93 g ‘oi=
g’ sfacarfea f&a s@Ew;

(xvill) & 25 & &T@W 2 #, @ (@) ¥ qHA HE WA “dq gad’ &
M 9 WeT ‘‘aiw gma sfaeatioa twR S

(XiX) ®. 25-% ¥ Ta#N 2 §, ToT (@) ¥ qUady 9@ wel d@| 9@ B
T QT WieT  C‘geRie oA’ dAfaearfog fwa @€,

(XX) ®. 26 ¥ Tq¥W 2 H, @2 (@) & Ay WA Wedl qeald €9
¥ WM T wsd qarg wa stecafoe fFA qw

(XXi) ¥ 28 & TATH 2 |, Tsel 'TH s’ B T T e Cqig squ”
sfaeafaa 7 'GITﬂ'ﬁ;
11

(XX11) & 29 F TN 2 H, Wwagt "'A15 I’ F TATA I W ‘T TG
afarattaa (w3 smaw;

(xxiii) ®. 35 % T@¥W 2 A, Toe () & araq W ‘9T ¢F 9F q¥ YFE”
* gTETE. WA Ul OF RqA q91H 9/ & W qT Neg ‘g
tqa’ afmrafea fea sam;

(xxiv) & 38 & wew 2 ¥, weal “3dw w0d” F W O W e T
gfeeafaa & s

(XXV) . 39 & TFH 2 H,-

(%) @ (F) F qrax WA 'REWS TIA & T G WeT “'q=rey
wun’’ afgrarfaa fFa SET; ;W

(@) mvr (@) & @AY ;eI QP Gt g 9T F WA ©
frmtafaa staenfea fwar smam ; wafa:—

‘Tl TEF W FFUA Ft AW O @ d4afud dva @
geeal (8 10) X @ g1 7

(XXvi) & 40 ¥ T¥W 2 ¥, @ (7T) ¥ qWA, agi wg W W ge A’
I g I W 9T T ‘qiw gad ' afaeantaa fea s

12



w4 (%) TG URYA, q9A 1, 1987 13

(XXvii) & 41 & T 2 H,-

(®) @v= (%) & @, wgt T2 W ez “oveim G qTF g IAT
A 9w ‘g g Sfzcutfog 39 e o

?
(@) @2 (@) & @ram, Sgt ol W@ v “owre & w@ A g
M 9 T qiw ¥ sfaeafaa 6l @

(xxvili) & 42 & @@ 2 §, wedl ‘@7 ¥a@” & e qT weT “oiw TaR”
Staeatiaa faq s

(XXIX) ® 43 & @ 2 &§,-

(®) @2 (F) & awd, vt “OF qaqr”’ F oA g7 WeT “aiw
v’ sfaenfya f&g smaq; s

(@) e (@) & araq, sfwafea “ow ewm, sfawaw dfw T
% & w7 qT gbtaerfra “ota oo, sfvwaw Sdre wad
aw " ateearfaa @ sEdy;

(XXX) ®. 45 & T 2 & qTgw H,—

(%) @ (%) & wedl “ferg 28" ¥ qwata, o west ‘@ @@
Qe 98 7§ T a7 meT Cqig wed” Sfaentas frn T,
0

(@) @ () & wedi “agi Qut {@ow % 5" & qeara W
el A ®IR qeErm 997 F vy o7 wee C'qiw o qfa-
wtaa feg wae

(XXX1) & 46 & T 2 {,-
(%) @v= (%) J,-
(1) se-@vs (%) & @wd, wedi “ag T’ & ewmt %
T “geg Tod sfaeenfon f5d wEw; g
(1) g% (@) ¥ Wy, Wt “Gavitn a0’ & e qx
weg “ate saa”’ sfaeenfo fed wmAR; Sie
(@) @3 (@) & amma , wedl “Adw sad” & @ o€ veT “dig
eaa | wfaeattun fed sEw;
(xxxii) & 48 & T 2 #,—

(%) @ (F) & @A, W ‘9 wad” & q % WeT i v’

g -,

gtaearfoa @ saw;

(@) @ (@) & awd, mwa [ '@ & et 0% wer “qi
R staeartaa fea s

13



14 REGTH AH-TF, ANA 1, 1987 AT 4 (%)
(=T) gug () F @A, Wl A TAq F TAW U WeT OEG
wqa’ wfaeatfaqa & smaw;

(Ef) f‘-’“g (a) % uma, meal “Adw '@’ & v X s CAE
&’ wtaeafug {69 S1aAw;  A;WR

(¥) @ve (=) & avad, weal “arfusa f6d @ wfa afwa & to@”
F QT WO Tl AT waA & T a7 wed Vo ' era-
rfaa fed s

(xxxiii) & 50 ¥ TFw 2 ¥, wl “diw Tad”’ & W a7 @ Yot wus”
afaeaiaa f&0 s,

(XXXiv) ®. 54 & @@ 2H, @2 (@) & @A W@ WG qArey 7oq &
T ¢ nE ‘g1z T’ sfaeaitaa & s

(XXxV) & 55 % T 2 #, @UT (@) & AraA AGE qeEl “qEW w9q g
T F W 97wy Yqarg @y Sfaeafaa @R oewEn;

(XXXV1) @. 57 % &7 2 H, @ (@) & FRT AT Weal - A 17 790 qA0H A
* WA 9T wsT gy Tun siaeatfod w9 s

(xxxvil) & 58 & wwew 2 #A,-

(¥) @ (ﬂ?) & qAT, Weal wgl gal foad aT qew” & q|
WA WEEl T 79T g FY & T X Wew “aiw v wfa-
carivy fed wm@n; WR

(@) @ve (@) & @as, weal “foeg | & qeang md weRl (A5

90 quET 87 ¥ 7 q¢ qer Ydva wud’ afgeatfrg fEa
SR ;

(xxxviii) & 61 F ¥ 2 §, @ (@) F arq MT A= ARG WA F TR
q¢ wes “‘oexg wqd”’ afaenfoa fex @AW,

r“*‘ﬁ
et

(XXXIX) & 64 & T 2 H,—

(7) @ve (%) & @A, wedt g a8 & TR WX w0 A
T ¥ TAI qT WeT Cateiin v’ Sfaeatu fed SE A W

(@) @ (@) & qraq, weal ‘farg wg’| & qyang AT q&& A159
ﬁwq"a“mcrit” ¥ W UT weT “dawqy’ Sfweafas fwd
ST ; A

(x1) . 65 % T 2 H, Wl “'gF e’ & TATA q) weE “aiw T Sia-
2o B M o L

14



Wi 4 (%) (AT AT, ATA 1, 1987 15

TEATI -V

TISEATH TS BYE qAT q12 qearwa wfafaww, 1961 § AMu

21. 1961 ¥ Twwaw wfufeaa 23 F1 ATTH 2 & TN, TS AT
AT BIR JAT ATE HeqTHA K(ETRAT, 1961 (1961 TV TIHEATH arafaw 23)
q W oagEl 2 H,-

(1) wA=3% 1 Heaww 3 &, wgi F¢ Wt W TATA AT A 2 Fﬁ”
o g, IAw oAt 9 we g Ot g Ataenfa fF8 9@

(ii) =87 3 & TWew 3 H-
(F) @ve (i) & @rad, M) U [T & TE ) 6T “ao waR
gfacarfag &g smaw;

(=) @ (i) & @rad, wed YR vt & rw ) e fdra T
afveatiqa f@7 s
(w) @z (iii) &~

(i) So-mwz (1) (F) ¥ @A, Wal 70 TF & WA G
wez “outa Toa sfaeafas f5d s@w;

(i) wo-mee (1) (@) & aRR, weal ata A & TAW T
ssT “qearg Taa’ wfaeatfaa e s

(iil) Sv-mve (2) (%) ¥ @R, N 70 TWA & T W
wse “qurg san Sfgeardoa fF9 Em; AR

(7) @og(iv) & awd, weal ‘oig 3@’ F WW O T I
tqq’ afgeafoa fwa  sman;

(i) =787 5 ¥ Taew 3 H, Wi FE A W T gAA0 AT W N 4
rd gi, 3% TArA q¥ wad ‘wig A7 afarafen fea s,

(iv) #w7e8T 6 & eq¥W 3 ¥, WA "UF gour’ F T qT W A IqA
sfacatfaa fea  sam;

(v) mts8e 7 & taew 3 &, wedl ‘o amr”’ Hi7 wead “at [ § w0
q¥ weg ‘g 'R’ sfaenfea w9 saw;

* "'h..”

(vi) mq=BT 9 ¥ Taww 3 W, WLl "TF THAT & TWEA X WY ‘A TR
afaenfoa fea  sra;

15



USEYTT -9, XA 1, 1987 il 4 (%)
(vil) =87 10 & wwm 3 ¥

(%) @z (%) (i) ¥ amad, wedl “drx Ted” 3 eqvA 9T g aeeta
'R’ wfaenfoa fed smon;

(@) @vs (%) (ii) ¥ amd, @& “aia god” & oW ® a2
“rEta san’ affeafua fed wmaw;

() =vx (=) & arad, wedl ‘o T’ ¥ AT 9T Wee Pty g
Staeanfes f&d smam;

() @z (7) & arad, ws “ow som”’ & TA0T I M atT TIR”
ataeatfor fe3 s

(®) @2 (w) (i) & =1ad, wsdf “aia q97” ¥ oA X Wew
" afarafaa fEd soa;

&3
(7) @ve (@) (ii)% amw, sl ‘g wvar” & vam oT e i
qq” afFeafas fed s,

() @z (=), (7), (v), () 5w (@) & v, ot g o v
"ow sar”’ Wl g, 3% eanA o7 war atw v’ W gt FE
A 3MeT 3T A" A g IR evA a rex aw vl wfaenfua
foa s

(vili ) =937 11 & @™ 3 H-
(%) av= (%), (=), (), (x), (%), (=), (®), () st (=)
F HIAA, gt FE WY Woxr ‘v wqar’ A g ITH T 9% ey
“qia gad”’ WY Agt FE W e Vata gEd A 39 T
X Wez ‘g wan’ afgenfoa R sna;

(T) =z (7) & amd, vt ‘R TR’ & T a2 meE Yam T
AT w2t “aa sqn”’ ¥ o9 9T e Ca=ty v sifaenfoa
fFq  SmT;

() @oz (@) & @A, q “aixw oA D ™ qT T HowEy

T’ W w=E TR TR F orm 91 9 ot s afy-
rqifaa fwa g

() @92 () & amw, e “oe=a so7 7 & T4 4T weT “am At

v’ wigeadoa feg smaw

(¥) @ (9) & amA, we=Ei T @ F om q¥ @ Yoeeim
gon’ afgenfem fed w@man;

(&) @z (7) & aEA, weat ‘TawTr” & w07 9T W o TR
wreel “aeai Tud”’ & T a7 wse ‘o |t zug” nik wen
‘R’ F TR aT e (ar at gavw vy afxeqifun fea
ST ;

16



w4 (%) AATAT qARA-GeA, AAA 1; 198 7 17

(ix) HATST 16 & T@*W 3 /, WG Fg! W W& "TF T WA g 7%
TR QT T2 ‘a7 T8’ RIT Teat ‘T aqq”’ & T I 70e ‘i {9
afweqrfas fad SdwT; I

(x) wfraw afafee & wid weg “dfame” & qwd @ea 3 AT weal T
s & T IX e “q=1q 197 sfaeatiaa R s 0

gq . AT, WA,

maF qfaa |

LEGISLATIVE DRAFTING DEPARTMENT
NOTIFICATION
Jaipur, April 1, 1987.

No.F. 2(8) Vidhai/87.—In pursuance of Clause (3) of Article 348 of
the Constitutior of India, the Governor is pleased to authorise the pub-
lication in the Rajasthan Gazette of the following translation in the
English language of Rajasthan Vitta Adhiniyam, 1987 (Adhiniyam San-

khya 7 San 1987) :—
(English Translation)

THE RAJASTHAN FINANCE ACT, 1987
(Act No. 7 of 1987)

(Received the Assent o the Governor on the 30th day of March, 1987)
An
Act

further to amend the Rajasthan Sales Tax Act, 1954, the Rajasthan

Eilectricity (Duty) Act, 1962, the Rajasthan Stamp Law (Adaptation) Act,
1952, and the Rajasthan Court Fees and Suits Valuation Act, 1961 in

order to give effect to the financial proposals of the State Government

for the Financial Year 1987-88 and to make certain other changes.

Be it cnacted by the Rajasthan State Legislature in the Thirty"
eighth Year of the Republic of India as follows:—

CHAPTER—I
Preliminary

1. Short title.—This Act may be called the Rajasthan FPinance Act,
1987.

2. Declaration under section 3, Rajasthan Act 23 of 1958.—In pur-
suance of section 3 of the Rajasthan Provisional Collection of Taxes Act,
1958 (Rajasthan Act 23 of 1938), 1t 1s hereby declared that it is expedient
in public interest that section 18 of this Act shall have immediate effect,

under the said Agct.
CHAPTER-II

Amendment in the Rajasthar Sales Tax Act, 1954.

3. Amendment of section 2, Rajasthan Act 29 of 1954.—In section 2
of the Rajasthan Sales Tax Act, 1954 (Rajasthan Act 29 of 1954), here-
inafter in this chapter referred to as the Sales Tax Act,—

(@) in clause (e), for the expression “Contract”, the expression
¢« “Contract” or ‘“Works-contract’ » shall be substituted ;

(b) for the existing clause (o), thc following shall be substituted,

17



18 AR qAH-q@A, FAS 1, 1987 w4 (%)

S T MR AR YT WY | IR T TR T T el A PR T T

namely:—

“(o) *“Sale”, with allits grammatical variations and cognate
expressions, means every transfer of property in goods (other than by
way of mortgage, hypothecation, charge or pledge) by one person to
another in the course of business for cash, or deferred payment or
other valuable consideration and Includes—

(i) a transfer, otherwise than in pursuance of a contract,
of property in goods for cash, deferred payment or
other valuable consideration;

(ii) a transfer of property in goods (whether as goods or in some
other form) made in the course of the execution of a
contract or works-contract;

(iii) a delivery of goods on hire-purchase or other system
of payment by instalments;

(iv) a transfer of the right to use goods for any purpose (whether
or not for a specified period) for cash, deferred payment
or other valuable consideration;

(v) a supply of goods by any unincorporated association or
body of persons to a member therecof for cash, deferred
payment or other valuable consideration;

(vi) a supply, by way of or as part of any service or in any other
manner whatsoever, of goods, being food or any other
article for human consumption ,or any drink (whether
or not intoxication), where such supply is for cash, deferred
payment or other valuable consideration —

and such transfer, delivery or supply shall be deemed to be a sale
and the word “purchase™ or “buy” shall be construed accordingly;

Explanation.—A. transfer of property in goods shall be deemed to have
been made within the state if it fulfils the requirements
of sub-section (2) of Section 4 of the Central Sales Tax
Act, 1956 (Central Act 74 of 1956);”;

(¢) in clause (p),—

(i) the existing words “of any goods™ occuiring between the
words “for the sale” and the expression, ¢less any sum”
shall be omitted,

(ii) for the existing proviso, the following shall be substituted,
namely :(—
““provided that in the case of a hire purchase agreement, the
market price of the goods on the date on which such goods

were transferred under such agreement shall be deemed to be
the sale price of the goods;”; and

?

(iii) after the existing proviso as so substituted, the following
new proviso shall be added, namely:—

“Provided further that the sale price in relation to a works-
contract shall be the amount payable in respect of its execu-
tion inclusive of the value of all goods and the labour
and other charges involved In such execution:”: and

18




W 4 (%) qAEIN  TH-T, FAA 1, 1987 19
e

(d) in clause (t),—

(i) for the existing expression occurring immediately before the
first proviso, the following shall be substituted, namely:—

‘“ “turnover” means the aggregate amount of sale prices recei-
ved or receivable for a sale, transfer, delivery or supply by
a dealer in any of the ways referred to in clause (0);*; and

(ii) in Explanation (i), after the expression “in relation to a contract?’
and before the expression, <be deemed to be”, the words
“or a works-contract’® and after the expression ““the cost of
labour”, the expression ‘“‘as may be prescribed;” shall be
inserted.

4. Insertion of new section 5-AAA in Rajasthan Act 29 of 1954.—After
Section 5-AA of the Sales Tax Act, the following new Section 5-AAA
shall be iInserted, namely:—

“5-4AAA. Validation of levy and collection of certain taxes.—(1)
Notwithstanding anything contained in any judgement, decision or order
of any court, tribunal or authority, all taxes levied or collected or purported
to have been levied or collected under this  Act In connection with a supply
as referred to in sub-clause (vi) of clause (0)of Section 2 in respect of the
neriod from 2nd February, 1983 to the date of commencement of the
Rajasthan Finance Act, 1987 shall, for all purposes, be deemed always
to have been validly levied or collected as if the said sub-clausef(vi) had
been in force at all material times when such tax was levied or collected.

(2) No suit or other proceeding shall be maintained or continued
in any court, tribunal or authority for refund of such tax as has been re-
ferred to in sub-section (1) and no court, tribunal or authority shall
enforce any judgement, decision or order whereby the amount of any such
tax was directed to be refunded.”.

5. Amendment of Section SE in Rajasthan Act 29 of 1954.—In Sec-
tion 5-E of the Sales Tax Act,—

(o) after the existing sub-section (3), the following new sub-section
shall be inserted, namely:—-

““(4) Notwithstanding anything contained in Section 5 but
subject to the first proviso to sub-section (1) thereof, every dealer,
whosc turnover Includes the turnover relating to sales in respect
of the transfer of the right to use any goods as referred to in sub-
clause(iv) of clause(o) of Section 2, shall pay tax under this Act
on the turnover relating to each occasion of such sales at such
rate not exceeding ten percent, as may be notified by the State
Government in the official Gazette and different rates of tax
may be notified for different goods or classes of goods or
different classes of dealers.””; and

(b) the existing sub-section (4) shall be re-nmumbered as sub-section
(5) and for sub-section (5) as sc re-pumbercd, the following shall
be substituted, namely :—

“(5) On a notification being issued under sub-section (1) or
sub-section (4), no tax in respect of sales referred to in the said
sub-sections shall be payable under section 3.”.

19



20 UAEIA TAR-AA, AT 1, 1987 art 4 (%)

-

6. Amendment of Section 5-H, Rajasthan Act 29 of 1954.—In sub-
section (1) of section 5-H of the Sales Tax Act, for the words “ten percent®’
ocourring between the words ““at the rate of”” and the words ““on the amount
of tax” the words “twenty percent” shall be substituted.

1. Amendment of Section TAA, Rajasthan Act 29 of 1954.-—In section
T-AA of the Sales Tax Act, for th> expression “‘rupces ten per day”, the
CXpression “rupees ten per day in th: case where tax is required to be paid
cvery moath under sub-section (2A) of section 7 and rupess five per day

In all other cases” and for the expression “the default, the expression
“the deafult in the furnishing of such return” shall be substituted.

8. Amendment of Section 9, Rajasthan Act 29 of 1954. —In sub-scction
(3) of scction 9 of the Sales Tax Act, the cxisting clause (a) and clause (b)
shall  respectively bz re-numbered as clauss (h) and slausz (¢) and before
clause (b) as so re-numbered, the following shall be inserted, namely:—

“(@) such firm, family or association may be assessed to tax payable
In respact of the turnover regarding all the goods and disposal
of other articlss of such firm, family or association as if there
was no such dissolution, discontinuance or partition and all the
provisions of this Act shall apply accordingly;”.

‘ 9. Amendment of Section 10-B, Rajasthan Act 29 of 1954. —In clause
(9) of sub-section (1) of section 10-B of th: Sales Tax Act, for the existing
word ““five”, tie word ““four” shall be substituted.

18.  Amendment of Section 11-B, Rajasthan Act 29 of 1954.—In section,
11-B of the Sales Tax Act,-—

(@) tn the Explanation to sub-section (1), between the expression
“10A,” and the expression “13 or 14 of this Act:” the expression
“12,” shall bes inserted: and

(6) for the existing words “one and a quarter percent”, wherever
occurring, the words “two percent’” shall be substituted and the
words “for a pcriod of three months and at one and a half per
cent per month thereafter”, wherever occurring, shall be deleted.

LI.  Amendment of Section 14, Rajasthan Act 29 of 1954.—In sub-

section (3) of section 14 of the Sales Tax Act, for the figures “180°°,the
figures “365°’ shall be substituted.

12.  Amendment of Section 16, Rajasthan Act 29 of 1954.—In clause
(h) of sub-section (3) of section 16 of the Sales Tax Act, after the existing
expresston‘‘demand notice by him;”’, the existing word ““or”’ shall be deemed
always to have bzen omitted and the following shall bs deemed always to
have been inserted, namely:—

“Explanation.—An offence under this clause shall be deemed to
be a continuing offence until payment is made.; or”.

13.  Amendment of Section 22, Rajasthan Act 29 of 1954.—-In clause (a)
of sub-325tton (6) of s2stion 22 of the Sales Tax Act, for the words “shall
have power to’" occurring between the words “Any such Authority or
person” and the words “seize and goods’’, the word “may” shall be
substituted.

20




R 4 (%) T AR, AXA 1, 1987 21

———
14. Amendment of Section 22-AA, Rajasthan Act 29 of 1954.—In

section 22-AA of the Sales Tax Act,—-

(@) In the marginal heading, for the existing words “and pErsons
transporting goods”, the words “‘and dalals” shall be substituted:

(h) in sub-sections (1), (2) and (3), the words “or any person trans-
porting goods within or out side the State”, wherever ocourring
shall be omitted; and

(c) clause (ii) of the Explanation shall be omitted.

15, Insertion of new section 22-C, Rajasthan Act 29 of 1954.—After
Section 22-B of the Sales Tax Act, the following ncw section shall be
Inserted namely :—

“22-C. Import of goods into the State against declaration.—(1) Any
person (heretnafter in this section referred toas the importer) who
lIntends to bring, import, or otherwise receive any goods from out-
stde the State, as notified by the State Government, of the value
of Rs. 1,000/~ or more for use, consumption or disposal within the
State, shall obtain the prescribed form of declaration on payment
of prescribed fee from the assessing authority having jurisdiction
over the area where his principal place of business is situated or
In ¢ase there is no such place, where he ordinarily resides:

Provided that where an tmporter intends to bring, import or otl_lerwise
rec2ive such goods otherwise than in sonnection with business, he
may, at his option, obtain the prescribed form of declaration and
where he fails to obtain such form of declaration, it shall be pre-
sumed that such goods have been purchased by such person within
the State.

(2) Such form of declaration shall be carricd with the goods and
presented at the entry checkpost alongwith other documents
prescribed under section 22-A and the provisions of the said
scction shall apply to such import.”.

16.  Amendment of Section 23, Rajasthan Act 29 of 1954.—In sub-
section (2) of section 23 of the Sales Tax Act, for the existing expression
“129 | the expression “24 % shall be substituted.

17. Amendment of Section 26, Rajasthan Act 29 of 1954.—In sub-
section (2) of section 26 of the Sales Tax Act, after the existing clause
(¢c), the following new clause shall be inserted, namely:—

“(cc) the determination of the amount payable to the dealer for the
iransfer of property in goods (whether as goods or In some
other form) made in the c¢ourse of executionofa contract or
works-contract;”.

Is. Amendment of the Schedule, Rajasthan Act 29 of 1954.—In the
Schedule appended to the Sales Tax Act,—

(@) at serial No. 2, the existing entry “(b) sugarcane’ shall be omitted; and

21



22 AREA OF-qA, TAA 1, 1987 WRT 4 (%)

(b) at serial No. 3, the words ““Fresh milk (whether whole or the fat
contents of which have been removed or reduced)” ogcurring

in the existing entry shall be omitted.

CHAPTER-III
Amendment in the Rajasthan Electricity (Duty) Act, 1962

19.  Amendment of Section 3, Rajasthan Act 12 of 1962.—In Section 3
of the Rajasthan Electricity (Duty) Act, 1962 (Rajasthan Act 12 of 1962),
for the expression “‘6 naye paise’” occurring between the expression ¢com-
puted at such rate, not exceeding” and the expression “per unit as may be

fixed”, the expression ‘“‘ten paise” shall be substituted.

CHAPTER-IV

Amendment in the Rajasthan Stamp Law (Adaptation) Act, 1952

20. Amendment of the Second Schedule, Rajasthan Act T of 1952.—In
the Sccond Schedule appended to the Rajasthan Stamp Law (Adaptation)

Act, 1952 (Rajasthan Act 7 of 1952),—-

(i) at No.1, in column 2, for the words “One rupee”, the words “Five
rupees’” shall be  substituted;

(i) at No. 2,—
(@) incolumn 1, the existing clauses (@) and (b) shall be omitted;

and
() in column 2, for the existing expressions against clauses
(@) and (b), the following shall be substituted, namely:—

“Five rupees for every hundred rupees, or part thereof,
of the value of the Bond subject to a maximum of fifty

rupees.’’;
(iif) at No. 3, in column 2, for the words “Thirty rupees”, the word

“Fifty rupees” shall be substituted;

(iv) at No. 4, in column 2, for the words “Five rupees”, the words
“Ten rupees” shall be substituted;

(v) at No. 5, in column 2,—

(¢) against clause (a), for the words “One rupee”, the words
“Five rupces” shall be substituted,

(b) against clause (b), for the expression “‘thrity rupees, one
rupce”, the expression “One hundred rupees, five rupees”

shall be substituted; and

(¢) against clause (c), for the words “Two rupees”, the words
“Five rupees” shall be substituted;

22



W 4 (%) THAEATT AHTGH AA A 1, 1987 23

_—____—_—__——-__——_‘——_—__-__—_

(vi) at No. 6, incolumns 1 and 2, for the existing expressions, the
following shall be substituted, namely:—

“6. Agreement relating to the deposit of title-deeds, pawn or
pledge i.e. any instrument evidencing an  agreement
relating to—

(1) the deposit of title-deeds or instruments constituting or
being evidence of the title to any property whatever,
other than a marketable security, or

(2) the pawn or pledge of movable property, where such deposit,
pawn or pledge has been made by way of security for the
repayment of money advanced or to be advanced by way
of loan or an existing or future debt,—

(a) if such loan or debt is repayable on demand or more
than three months from the date of the instrument evide-
ncing the agreement,—

(i) where the amount of the loan or  Five rupees,
debt does not exceed Rs. 1,200/-;

(ii) where it exceeds Rs. 1,200/- bul Fifteen rupees.
does not exceeds Rs. 5,000/-;

(i) where it exceed Rs. 5,000/- but  Thirty rupees.
does not exceed Rs. 10,000/- ;

(iv) where it exceeds Rs. 10,000/- but  Eighty five
does not exceed Rs. 33,000/- ; rupees.

(v) where it exceeds Rs. 30,000/- but  One hundred
does not exceed Rs. 50,000/- ; and twenty {1ve
rupees.

(vi) where it exceeds Rs. 50,000/-, for  Thirty rupees.
every Rs. 10,000/- or part thereof,
in excess of Rs. 50,000 /- ; and

(b) if such loan or debt is re-payable not  Half the duty
more than three months from the date payable under
of such 1nstrument. clause (a) for

the amount

secured.
Exemptions.

Instruments of pawn or pledge of agricultural produce, if un-
attested. |

(vii) at No. 7, in column 2, for the words “Thirty-eight rupees™, the
~words “Fifty rupees’ shall be substituted ;

(viii) at No. 8, in column 2, for the words “Thirty-seven rupees fifty

paise” ocourring against clause (b), the words “Fifty rupees”
shall be substituted;

28



2 4 AT AH T AT 1, 1987 a4 (%)

(ix) at No. 9, incolumn 2, for the words “Fifteen rupecs”, the
words “Twenty rupees’” shall be substituted;

(x) at No. 10, in columns 1 and 2, for the existing expressions, the
following shall be substituted, namely:—

“10. Articles of Association of a Company,—

(i) Where the share capital does not exceed  Two hundred
Rs. 1 lac; rupees.

(i Where it exceeds Rs. 1.00 la¢ but does One thousand
not cxceed Rs. 5 lacs; rupees.

(iif) Where it exceeds Rs. 5 lacs but does not Three thousand
exceed Rs. 20 lacs; and rupees.

(iv) Where it exceeds Rs. 20 lacs, for every  One thousand

Rs.5 lacs or part thereof, in excess of rupces.
Rs. 20 lacs.

Exemption.

Articles of any Association not  formed for profit and
registered under section 26 of the Companies Act, 1955.

(xi) atNo. 12, in column 2, for the words ‘“‘Thirty seven rupees

fifty paise” occurring against clause (b), the words “Fifty rupees”
shall be substituted,

(xii) at No. 15, in columns 1 and 2, for the existing expressions,
the following shall be substituted, namely:—

“15. Bond as defined in sub-section (5) of section 2 not being
a debenture and not otherwise provided for by this Act or
by the Court Fees Act, 1870 (Central Act 7 of 1870),
as adapted to Rajasthan,—

() Where the amount or value secured does Five rupees.
not c¢xceed Rs.100/-;

(i) Where it exceeds Rs. 100/-, but does Ten rupees.
not exceed Rs. 500/-; -

24



w4 (W) RPN TR, WE® 1, 1987 25

(xiii) at No.17, in column 2, for the words “Twelve rupees”, the
words ‘“Fifteen rupees” chall be substituted;

(xiv) at No.18, in column 2,—

(@) against clause (a), for the words “Fifty paise”,

the words ‘‘Five rupees’® shall be substi-
tuted; and

(b) against clause (b), for the words *“‘Seventy

five paise’, the words ““Five rupees” shall
be substituted;

(xv) at No.22, in column 2, for the words “Thirtyfour rupeces”
the words “Fortyfive rupees’” shall be substituted;

(xvi) at No.23, in columns 1 and 2, for the existing expressions,
the following shall be substituted, namely.—

““23. Conveyance as defined in sub-section (10) of section 2,—

(i) Where the market value does not exceed Fifteen rupees.
Rs.200/-;

(i) Where it excecds Rs.200/-, but does not  Thirtyfive
exceed Rs.500/-; rupees.

(iif) Where it excecds Rs.500/-, but does not  Seventy rupees.
exceed Rs. 1,000/-;

(iv) Where it exceeds Rs.1,000/-, but does Fortyfive
not exceed Rs.10,000/-, for every Rs.500/-  rupces.
or part thereof, in excess of Rs. 1,000/-;

(v) Where it exceeds Rs.10,000/-, but does Fiftytive rupees.
not exceed Rs.25,000/-, for cvery Rs.500/-

or part thereof, in excess of Rs. 10,000/-;

(vi) Wklere it exceeds Rs.25,000/-, but does Scventy rupzees.
not exceed Rs.50,000/-, for every Rs.500/-

or part thereof, in excess of Rs. 25,000/-;

(vii) Where it exceeds Rs. 50,000/, for every  Eightyfive
Rs. 50C/- or part thereof, in excess of rupees.
Rs. 50,000/-.
'Egcempﬁon..

Assigqment of c0py-rfght by entfy made under the Indian
Copyright Act, 1957.

(xv;z'i) at ‘No.'24, in ¢olumn 2,—

(a) against clause (i), for.the words “Two rupees”, the words
“Five rupees” shall be substituted; and

23



26 AT TA-q, WA 1, 1987 T 4 (F)

(b) against clause (i), for the words ““Three rupees”, the words
“Five rupees” shall be substituted:

(xvili) at No. 25, in column 2, for the words ““Three rupees” occurring
against clause (b), the words “Five rupees” shall be substituted;

(xix) at No. 25A, in column 2, for the words “Twenty rupees”
occurring against clause (b), the words “Twentyfive rupees”
shall be substituted:

(xx) at No. 26, in column 2, for the words “Twenty five rupees”
occurring against clause (b), the words ““Thirtyfive rupees’ shall
be substituted;

(xxi) at No. 28, in column 2, for the words “One rupee”, the words
“Five rupees” shall be substituted;

(xxii) at No. 29, in column 2, for the words ““Eight rupees”, the words
*Ten rupees” shall be substituted :

(xxili) at No. 35, in column 2, against clause (c), for the words “One
rupee and fifty paise”, occurring after the words ““the duty on
such lease shall not exceed’, the words ““Five rupees” shall be
substituted;

(xxiv) at No. 38, in column 2, for the words “Twentythree rupees®,
the words ““Thirty rupees” shall be substituted ;

(xxv) at No. 39, in column 2,—

(a) against clause (a), for the words “Sixtyeight rupees’, the
words ‘“Eightyfive rupeses’ shall be substituted; and

(b) against clause (b), for the words “Two hundred twentyfive
rupees’’, the following shall be substituted, namely:—

“The same duty as on Articles of Association (No. 10) per-
taming to the share capital of the company.”:

(xxvi) at No. 40, in column 2, against clause (¢), for the words “One
rupee”, wherever occurring, the words “Five rupees’” shall be
substituted:

(xxvii) at No. 41, in column 2,—
(@) against clause (a), for the words “Twentyfive paise”, where-

ever occurring, the words “Five rupees” shall be substituted:
and

(b) against clause (b), for the words “Fifty paise”, wherever
occurring, the words “Five rupees’® shall be substituted:

(xxviii) at No. 42, in column 2, for the words “Three rupees”, the
words “Five rupees” shall be substituted ;



wit 4 (w) TEEAT qAqN, URA 1, 1987 27
| e e -
(xxix) at No. 43, in column 2,— _

(a) against clause (a), for the words “One rupee”, the words
“Five rupees” shall be substituted; and

(b) against clause (b), for the express‘ion ‘“twenty rupees ,
One rupee”, the expression “thrity five rupees, five rupees”

shall be substituted;

(xxx) at No. 45, in column 2, in the proviso,—

(@) in clause (a), for the words *“two rupees and twentyfive
pais=” occurring after the words “‘but shall not be less than™
the words “five rupees’ shall be substituted; and

() in clause (c), for the words two rupees twentyfive paise’
occurring after the words ‘‘shall not exceed”, the words

“five rupees’’ shall be substituted;

{xxxi) at No. 46, in column 2,—
(@) in clause (A),—

(i) against sub-clause (a), for the words “Twelve rupees” -
the words “‘Fifteen rupees’’ shall be substituted; and

(i) against sub-clause (b), for the words “Fortyfive rupees”
the words “‘Sixty rupees’’ shall be substituted; and

(b) against clause (B), for the words ““Twentythree rupees”
the words ‘“Thirty rupees” shall be substituted;

{xxxii) at No. 48, in column 2,—

(a) against clause (a), for the words ““Two rupees”, the words
‘“Five rupees’’ shall be substituted ;

(b) against clause (b), for the words “Three rupees”, the words
“Five rupees’ shall be substituted ;

(¢) against clause (c), for the words “Twelve rupees”, the words
“Fifteen rupees” shall be substituted ;

(d) against clause (d), for the words “Twentythree rupees”,
the words *Thirty rupees’ shall be substituted; and

(e) against clause (f), for the words “Three rupses’” occurring
before the words “for each person authorised”, the words

“Five rupees” shall be substituted;

(¥xxiil) at No. 50, in column 2, for the words ‘““Three rupees”, the
' words “Five rupees” shall be substituted ;

{»xxiv) at No. 54, in column 2, for the words “Forty five rupees”,

occurring against clause (b), the words “Sixty rupees”
shall be substituted ;

27



28 TRASHT UG, B9« 1, 1987 w4 (%)
O
(xxxy) at No. 55, in ¢clumn 2, for the words ““Thirtyseven 1upees
fifty paise” occurring against clause (b), the words “Fifty

rupees’” shall be substituted ;

(xxxvi) at No. 57, in column 2, for the words “Thirty seven rupces
fifty paise” occurring against clause (b), the words “Fifty
rupees’’ shall be substituted ;

(xxxvii) at No. 58, in column 2,—

(@) against clause A, for the words “One rupee fifty paise”
occurring after the words “shall not exceed”, the words
“Five rupees” shall be substituted; and

(b) against clause B, for the words “‘twentytwo rupees fifty
paise” occurring after the words “but not exceeding”, the
words ““thirty rupees” shall be substituted ;

(xxxviij) at No. 61, in column 2, for the words “Twelve rupces’
occurring against clause (b), the words ‘“Fifteen rupees”
shall be substituted;

(xxxix) at No. 64, in column 2,—

(@) against clause A, for the words “thirty rupees” occurring
after the words “‘but not exceeding’’, the words ““forty rupees™
shall be substituted : and

(b) agains? clause B, for the words “twentytwo rupees twenty.
five paise” occurring after the word “exceeding”, the words
“thirty rupsges” shall be substituted; and

(xI) at No. 65, in column 2, for the words ““One rupee”, the words
“Five rupees” shall be substituted.

CHAPTER—V
Amendments in the Rajasthan Court Fees and Suits Valuation Act, 1961

21. Amendment of Schedule IlI, Rajasthan Act 23 of 1961.—In
Schedule II appended to the Rajasthan Court Fees and Suits Valuation
Act, 1961 (Rajasthan Act 23 of 1961),—

(i) in article 1, in column 3, for the words “Ten rupces’ and the
words ‘“Twenty rupees”, wherever occurring, the werds “One
hundred rupees” shall be substituted ;

(i) in article 3, in column 3,—
(@) against clause (i), for the words “One rupee”, the words
“Ten rupees” shall be substituted;

~ (b) against clause (i), for the words “Two rupees”, the words
"‘T : ,’ ! "“ - s i
Twenty rupces’ shall be substituted;

28



i 4 (%) UAEMA WA-GRA, WIT 1, 1987

(¢) 1n clause (1i1),—

29

(i) against sub-clause (1) (a), for the words “Ten rupees”,
the words “Fifty rupees” shall be substituted ;

(1) against sub-clause (1) (b), for the words “Five rupees”,
the words “Twentyfive rupees” shall be substituted;

(iif) against sub-cluase (2) (a), for the words ““Ten rupees?,
the words *Fifty rupees” shall be substituted ; and

(d) against clause (iv), for the words “‘Five rupees’’, the words
“Fifty rupees” shall be substituted ;

(iii) 1n article 5, in column 3, for the words ‘‘One rupee’’, wherever
P

occurring, and for the words *“Two rupees”, the words ‘Five
rupces’’ shall be substituted ;

(iv) in article 6, 1n column 3, for the words ““One rupee”’, the words
“Two rupees” shall be substituted ;

(v) 1n article 7, in coulmn 3, for the words “One rupee” and the

words “Two rupees’”, the words *“‘Five rupees’ shall be substi-
tuted ;

(vi) in article 9, in column 3, for the words “One rupee’’, the words
“Five rupees” shall be substituted ;

(vii) in article 10, in column 3, —

(@) against clause (a) (1), for the words “Three rupees”, thewords
“Twentyfive rupees’ shall be substituted ;

(b) against clause (a) (i1), for the words “Five rupees”, the
words ‘‘Fifty rupees” shall be substituted ;

(c) against clause (b), for the words ‘‘One rupee’”, the words
| “‘Five rupees’ shall be substituted ;

(d) against clause (¢), for the words “One rupee”, the words
“Five rupces’” shall be substituted ;

(e) against clause (d) (1), for the words “Five rupees”, the words
“Ten rupees” shall be substituted ; '

(f) against clause (d) (ii), for the words “‘One rupee”, the words
~ “Five rupees” shall be substituted ; and

(2) against clauses (e), (f), (g), (h) and (i), for the words “One
rupee”’, wherever occurring, the words “Five rupees” and

for the words ““Two rupees”, wherever occurring, the words
“Ten rupees” shall be substituted:

29



30

TSGEIR TAA-99, AGA 1, 1987 i 4 (¥F)

(viii) in article 11, in column 3,—

(@) against clauses (a), (b), (¢), (), (¢), (f), (), (h) and (1), for
the words “One rupee” wherever occurring, the words “Five
rupees” and for the words “Five rupees’’, wherever occur-

rimg, the words “Ten rupees” shall be substituted :

(6) against clause (k), for the words “Two rupees’’, the words
“Ten rupees” and for the words ““Ten rupees™, the words
“Fifty rupees” shall be substituted :

(c) against clause (p), for the words “Five rupees”, the words
“Twenty five rupees” and for the words “Ten rupees”, the
words “Fifty rupees” shall be substituted ;

(d) against clause (r), for the words “Twenty five rupees”, the
words “One hundred ruppees” shall be substituted ;

(¢) against clause (s), for the words “Two rupees”, the words
“Twentyfive rupees”, shall be substituted:

(f) against clause (t), for the words “Ten rupees”’, the words
“Fifty rupees”, for the words “Twentyfive rupees”, the
words “One hundred rupees”, and for the. words “Fifty

rupees”, the words “Two hundred fifty rupees” shall be
substituted :

{ix) in article 16, in column 3, for the words “One rupee”” wherever
occurring, the words “Two rupees” and for the words “Two
rupees”, the words “Five rupees” shall be substituted ; and

(¥) against the words “Caveat” in the last entry for, the words “Ten

Tfupees™ occurring in column 3, the words “Fifty rupees” shall
be substituted.

qai mtw ﬁaﬁ’
Secretar y to the Government.

L= L T ——— [T

Government Central Press, Jaipur,

3G



